Liberty County
Bid #19-02 Gasoline and Diesel Fuel
Addendum No. 1
Previous bid tabulations and copies of invoices from current awarded vendors are attached per
inquiry request.
The following questions have also been posed:
1) Do you typically order more than 1 location at a time (split delivery)?

No. Orders are placed individually by each department.

2) What is the average size of delivery per individual location or if a split delivery is

requested?
Location Unleaded ‘87 Unleaded ‘89 ULSD #2 B-5 Bio Diesel
Precinct 1 - Raywood 783 1025 0 1087
Precinct 2 - Hardin (A) 800 694 0 1319
Precinct 2 - Tarkington (B) 850 0 1283 0
Precinct 3 - Cleveland 895 0 1169 0
Precinct 4 — Dayton 581 0 0 898

3) Are the tanks above or below ground?

Tanks located at Precincts 1 and 2 (A&B) are below ground. Tanks located at Precincts
3 and 4 are above ground.

4) Do you typically order both products at one time?
Approximately 66% of the orders contained more than one type of fuel.
5) Do you own the current tanks?

Yes, Liberty County owns the tanks.



6) Are you currently and OPIS subscriber?

No, Liberty County is not currently an OPIS subscriber.

If you have any further questions, please call me at (936) 336-4607.

Thanks,

Harold Seay
Liberty County Purchasing Agent



Bids are listed by precinct with the lowest bidder (winning bid) first with alternative vendors following in order of

LIBERTY COUNTY, TEXAS
BID # 18-01
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID TABULATION SHEET

bid. Winning bids are in the larger, bolded, dark blue font.

Commodity (Amt. Over OPIS Price)*

Unleaded '87 | Unleaded '89 | Unleaded '90+| #2 ULSD B5 Biodiesel
Precinct #1 J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Precinct #2 - Hardin J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Precinct #2 - Tarkington Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000
J. Hebert 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Precinct #3 Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000
J. Hebert 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Precinct #4 J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Sheriff's Dept. - Liberty J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Sheriff's Dept. - Cleveland | Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000
J. Hebert 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500

Liberty County reserves the right to accept or reject in part or in whole any bids submitted, and to waive any technicalities for the best interest of Liberty County.




LIBERTY COUNTY, TEXAS
BID # 17-03
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL BID TABULATION SHEET

Bids are listed by precinct with the lowest bidder (winning bid) first with alternative vendors following in order of
bid. Winning bids are in the larger, bolded, dark blue font.

Commodity (Amt. Over OPIS Price)*

Unleaded '87 | Unleaded '89 | Unleaded '90+| #2 ULSD B5 Biodiesel
Precinct #1 J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Sun Coast 0.9860 0.9860 0.9860 0.9860 0.9860
Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 no bid 0.1000 0.1000
Precinct #2 - Hardin J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000
Sun Coast 0.1295 0.1295 no bid 0.1295 0.1295
Precinct #2 - Tarkington Whitener 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775
Sun Coast 0.1425 0.1425 no bid 0.1425 0.1425
J. Hebert 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Precinct #3 Whitener 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775
J. Hebert 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Sun Coast 0.1985 0.1985 no bid 0.1985 0.1985
Precinct #4 J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000
Sun Coast 0.1250 0.1250 no bid 0.1250 0.1250
Sheriff's Dept. - Liberty J. Hebert 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890 0.0890
Whitener 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000 0.1000
Sun Coast 0.1985 0.1985 no bid 0.1985 0.1985
Sheriff's Dept. - Cleveland | Whitener 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775 0.0775
J. Hebert 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500 0.1500
Sun Coast 0.2985 0.2985 0.2985 0.2985 0.2985

Liberty County reserves the right to accept or reject in part or in whole any bids submitted, and to waive any technicalities for the best interest of Liberty County.
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